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2019 MICHAEL H WISE II MEMORIAL GOLF OUTING 
 
Save the date and mark your calendar!  It’s time for the 15th Annual Michael H 
Wise II Memorial Golf Outing.  This year’s Outing will be held June 22, 2019 at 
Fairview Golf Course in Lebanon, PA.  For those of you that have supported the 
Outing in the past, we sincerely thank you and hope we can count on your 
continued support.  For those of you that haven’t there are a number of ways to 
get involved – golfing, tee sponsorships, raffle and monetary donations are 
several ways to support this great event. 
 
Michael Wise II was 32 years old when he was killed in the line of duty in June 
2004 while serving as a Reading Police Officer.  As a way to celebrate his life 
and do good things in his name, Mike’s friends, family and co-workers created 
the Michael H Wise II Memorial Foundation, Inc.  All proceeds from the Golf 
Outing benefit the Foundation directly.  The Wise family receives no 
compensation from this or any other events held by the Foundation.  
 
Mike was a 1990 Cedar Crest High School graduate, a 1993 graduate of the 
Center for Emergency Medicine in Pittsburgh, PA and a 2002 graduate of the 
Reading Police Academy.  He served the public first as an EMT/Paramedic and 
then as a Police Officer.  Once again a portion of the proceeds from this event 
will fund the Michael H Wise II Memorial Scholarship at Cedar Crest High School.  
The Scholarship is awarded to students who are interested in pursuing a career 
in public service, specifically law enforcement or emergency medical services.   
Mike performed both of these careers passionately and we look forward to 
providing an opportunity for someone else to follow their passion. 
 
Please review the enclosed flyer for further details on the event.  We appreciate 
any involvement you may choose.  For more information about the events that 
benefit the Foundation, please visit www.wisememorial.com.  Thank you. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
The Michael H. Wise II Memorial Golf Committee 
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